	
	
	



[image: Text

Description automatically generated with low confidence]


Please Note:
This template is intended for educational purposes only, without any express or implied warranty of any kind, including warranties of accuracy, completeness, or fitness for any particular purpose.  You agree that your use of the template is without any recourse whatsoever to PG&E, SCE, SDG&E, or their affiliates. The template is a draft, and anyone using this document should seek the advice of an attorney to develop appropriate ordinance language to meet its jurisdiction’s specific needs, as state and local laws may differ.

Please contact the Codes and Standards Reach Codes Team at info@LocalEnergyCodes.com for additional information.




This program is funded by California utility customers and administered by Pacific Gas and Electric Company, San Diego Gas & Electric Company (SDG&E®), and Southern California Edison Company under the auspices of the California Public Utilities Commission and in support of the California Energy Commission.


	
	
	





Model Ordinances
All-Electric New Buildings and Renovations Code
Energy Reach Code for New Buildings 
Version 1.4
March 15, 2023
Changes from Prior Versions
Please check LocalEnergyCodes.com to obtain the latest version of this document.  This document will be updated frequently to comport with new features in the Cost Effectiveness Explorer.
Changes since Version 1.0:
· Version 1.1: Modified definition of All-Electric definition to extend to gas lines within the property lines and enumerated additional end uses.
· Version 1.2: Moved all-electric requirements from Site Development to Enviornmental Quality sections of CALGreen.
· Version 1.3: Updated to incorporate results from the nonresidential new construction cost effectiveness study.  Requires any exceptions from the all-electric requirements to meet higher energy performance standards. Added compliance exception for all-electric hotels/motels.
· Version 1.4: Added multifamily to the efficiency ordinance. Clarified and expanded all-electric process load exceptions.  Added instructions for all-electric ADUs. Edited text on revocable all-electric exceptions. Added prohibition to converting an all-electric building to a mixed-fuel building at a later date.
[bookmark: _Toc1187150530][bookmark: _Toc543197784]Scope
· Single Family, Multifamily and Nonresidential
· All-Electric.  Required for all new construction. Any exceptions must meet higher performance requrements.  Adopt both ordinances.
· Electric Preferred. Mixed fuel buildings must meet higher performance requrements and install additional PV in new buildings (optional). 
Introduction
This document is supported by the Cost Effectiveness Explorer, an interactive tool that allows users to customize requirements and estimate the projected impacts in their community. 
This document contains two different mechanisms for the all-electric requirements: 1) amending the Building Code, Title 24, Part 11, California Green Building Code; and, 2) adopting the requirements in another part of the local code.  These mechanisms have not been thoroughly tested; local jurisdictions should consult with their attorneys before proceeding.
The model reach code provides a performance compliance pathway for efficiency and an optional prescriptive pathway for PV.  Prescriptive compliance pathways for efficiency may also be provided for multifamily buildings once the studies are complete.  A prescriptive pathway for single family buildings is available upon request but is not included in this template. 
The model reach code amends the 2022 California Energy Code, effective January 1, 2023 through December 31, 2025. It is based on the latest cost-effectiveness studies, which may be downloaded from LocalEnergyCodes.com.
Any amendments to the Energy Code (Title 24, Part 6) appear in strikeouts (deletions) and underlines (additions). These amendments must be approved by the California Energy Commission (CEC) and must also be filed with the California Building Standards Commission.  
Jurisdictions may wish to modify elements of the ordinance, such as those marked with the text “[Optional]”.  When modifying the language, ensure all references are maintained and that the ordinance still meets the CEC requirements. Also, edit the Purpose section to reflect the changes.
The headings, footnotes and instructions (in blue) are for staff reference and should be removed from the final ordinance.
The draft ordinance text and CEQA determination language are provided as examples only.  Ensure all ordinance materials are reviewed and verified by relevant jurisdiction staff and the city/county attorney.


Sample All-Electric New Buildings/Major Renovations Code
The text below is largely based on a model code from BayAreaReachCodes.org and ordinances from Berkeley, San Luis Obispo, Santa Cruz, and San Francisco.

DELETE ALL BLUE TEXT AND FOOTNOTES

Option 1: Amend CALGreen
ORDINANCE AMENDING THE [City/County of Jurisdiction] BUILDING CODE TO 
REQUIRE ALL ELECTRIC BUILDINGS

Amendments 
The California Building Code, Title 24, Part 11, adopted by the [City/County of jurisdiction] codified under Chapter [municipal/county code reference (if not adopted in entirety, include local code references for each section)], is amended as specified below.  

Section 202 DEFINITIONS, is modified by adding the following definitions: 

ALL-ELECTRIC BUILDING is a building that contains no combustion equipment or plumbing for combustion equipment (except for abandoned gas lines) serving space heating (including fireplaces), water heating (including pools and spas), cooking appliances (including barbeques), and clothes drying, within the building or building property lines, and instead uses electric heating appliances for service.  An All-Electric Building may include solar thermal collectors. [Modify end uses as needed.  The reference to abandoned gas plumbing makes this definition compatible with the model renovation ordinance. The reference to solar thermal panels clarifies that solar thermal is an allowed energy source for heating.]

[Optional. Modify to conform to local definition] ATTACHED ACCESSORY DWELLING UNIT is a unit that is no more than 500 square feet in size and contained entirely within a single-family residence. An Attached Accessory Dwelling Unit may include separate sanitation facilities or may share sanitation facilities with the existing structure.

[Optional] COMMERCIAL FOOD HEAT-PROCESSING EQUIPMENT is equipment used in a food establishment for heat-processing food or utensils and that produces grease vapors, steam, fumes, smoke, or odors that are required to be removed through a local exhaust ventilation system, as defined in the California Mechanical Code. 

[Optional. Modify to conform to local definition] FREE-STANDING ACCESSORY DWELLING UNIT is a detached building that is not intended for sale separate from the primary residence, on a lot that is zoned for single family or multifamily use, located on the same lot as an existing dwelling, and does not exceed 1,200  square feet[footnoteRef:2] of total floor area. [2:  This is the default maximum ADU size under State law.  Cities may limit ADUs to as small as 850 square feet or as large as they wish.] 


FUEL GAS. A gas that is natural, manufactured, liquefied petroleum, or a mixture of these. 

FUEL GAS INFRASTRUCTURE is Fuel Gas piping in or in connection with a building, structure or within the property lines of premises, extending from the point of delivery at the gas meter or gas tank as specified in the California Mechanical Code and Plumbing Code. 

The definition of Substantial Remodel should be carefully crafted to ensure that it does not have unintended consequences elsewhere in the local code.  Sample text is provided below.  For a more thorough discussion see Substantial Remodels and New Construction Definitions. 

SUBSTANTIAL REMODEL [Examples below] 
· is any repair, reconstruction, rehabilitation, alteration, addition, or other improvement of a building structure, the cost of which equals or exceeds 50 percent of the market value of the structure before the improvement or repair is started. If the structure has sustained substantial damage, any repairs are considered substantial improvement regardless of the actual repair work performed.3 

·  is any alteration(s) made within any three-year period that includes replacement of over 50 percent of the existing foundation for purposes other than a repair or reinforcement as defined in California Existing Building Code Section 202; or where over 50 percent of the existing framing above the sill plate is removed or replaced for purposes other than repair. 

· is any project that requires an electrical permit, a mechanical permit and a plumbing permit, with the exception of projects with a total valuation of less than $XX,XXX [specify value].

Residential Requirements 

Section 4.504.6 is added to read as follows: 
4.504.6 Fuel Gas. All Newly Constructed and Substantially Remodeled Residential and Hotel/Motel buildings shall be designed and constructed as All-Electric Buildings. Fuel Gas Infrastructure may not be extended to any All-Electric building which was originally constructed under a building permit application submitted on or after the effective date of this Chapter.

Any buildings exempted from these requirements shall comply with the requirements below:
(a)	Install sufficient reserved circuit breakers and electrical conduit to facilitate future full building electrification as certified by affidavit of either a Registered Design Professional or a Licensed Electrical Contractor.

(b)	Meet the requirements of Section 140.1 of the Energy Code, Title 24, Part 6 as amended.

Exception 1 to 4.504.6: Any project for improvement of a building required to correct existing health, sanitary or safety code violations identified by the building official and that are the minimum necessary to assure safe living conditions. 

Exception 2 to 4.504.6: If the applicant establishes that there is not an all-electric prescriptive compliance pathway for the building under the California Building Energy Efficiency Standards, and that the building is not able to achieve the performance compliance standard applicable to the building under the Energy Efficiency Standards using commercially available technology and an approved calculation method, or if it is not technically feasible to meet the requirements of this Section, then the local enforcing agency may grant a modification. 

Alternative: If the applicant demonstrates that it is physically or technically infeasible to build without Fuel Gas Infrastructure the local enforcing agency may grant a modification. 

[Optional. If used, add ADUs to definitions.] 
Exception X to 4.504.6: Free-Standing Accessory Dwelling Units [cost-effective ADUs are limited to a few climate zones/utilities]
Exception X to 4.504.6: Water heating or space heating in an Attached Accessory Dwelling Unit in which new services are provided by existing systems from an existing mixed fuel building.
[Optional] Exception X to 4.504.6:  Notwithstanding the requirements of this Chapter, minimally necessary and specifically tailored Fuel Gas Infrastructure shall be allowed in a Newly Constructed Building or Substantial Remodel on a revocable basis until the excepted uses below no longer exist in the building.  At such time, the Fuel Gas Infrastructure shall be capped, otherwise terminated or removed, and the gas meter shall be removed, by the entity previously entitled to the exemption in a manner pursuant to all applicable Codes.  The following uses are subject to this exception:
· Commercial Food Heat-Processing Equipment
· A swimming pool that is provided as a public amenity
· Spas
· [List of any other occupancies that are to be subject to this exemption]

Non-Residential Requirements (including high-rise residential) 

Section 5.509 is added to read as follows: 
5.509 Fuel Gas. All Newly Constructed and Substantially Remodeld Nonresidential buildings shall be designed and constructed as All-Electric Buildings.  Fuel Gas Infrastructure may not be extended to any All-Electric building which was originally constructed under a building permit application submitted on or after the effective date of this Chapter.


Any buildings exempted from these requirements shall comply with the requirements below:
(a)	Install sufficient reserved circuit breakers and electrical conduit to facilitate future full building electrification as certified by affidavit of either a Registered Design Professional or a Licensed Electrical Contractor.

(b)	Meet the requirements of Section 140.1 of the Energy Code, Title 24, Part 6 as amended.

Exception 1 to 5.509: If the applicant establishes that there is not an all-electric prescriptive compliance pathway for the building under the California Building Energy Efficiency Standards, and that the building is not able to achieve the performance compliance standard applicable to the building under the Energy Efficiency Standards using commercially available technology and an approved calculation method, or if it is not technically feasible to meet the requirements of this Section, then the local enforcing agency may grant a modification. 

Alternative: If the applicant demonstrates that it is physically or technically infeasible to build without Fuel Gas Infrastructure the local enforcing agency may grant a modification. 

Exception 2 to 5.509: Provision of Natural Gas Infrastructure for certain end uses when no all-electric alternative is commercially available or viable. End uses eligible for technical exemptions are: 
1. Back-up power for Essential Facilities, as defined in the California Building Code, Chapter 2, Section 202, Definitions
2. Process Loads in a Newly Constructed manufacturing, industrial, healthcare or laboratory facility. For manufacturing, industrial, hospital or laboratory facilities with unknown tenants, exemptions may be provided pending review of initial tenant occupancy.

Exception 3 to 5.509: Inactive Fuel Gas Infrastructure may be extended to spaces that are anticipated to qualify for the exceptions contained in this chapter. The inactive Fuel Gas Infrastructure shall not be activated or otherwise used unless the exemptions specified in this chapter have been confirmed as part of the issuance of a building permit. 

Exception 4 to 5.509: Any project for improvement of a building required to correct existing health, sanitary or safety code violations identified by the building official and that are the minimum necessary to assure safe living conditions. 

Exception 5 to 5.509: The local enforcing agency may grant a modification for Substantial Remodels to a tenant-occupied portion of a building that was originally permitted before the effective date of this ordinance. [The intent is to exempt a tenant improvement from triggering electrification of the entire building].

[Optional] Exception X to 5.509: Gas infrastructure reserved for Fuel Gas exclusively composed of or generated by renewable energy sources.

[Optional] Exception X to 5.509: Spas.

[Optional] Exception X to 5.509:  Notwithstanding the requirements of this Chapter, minimally necessary and specifically tailored Fuel Gas Infrastructure that qualify for exceptions under this Section shall be allowed in a Newly Constructed Building or Substantial Remodel on a revocable basis until the excepted uses below no longer exist in the building.  At such time, the Fuel Gas Infrastructure shall be capped, otherwise terminated or removed, and the gas meter shall be removed, by the entity previously entitled to the exemption in a manner pursuant to all applicable Codes. 




Option 2: Other Local Code Adoption
ORDINANCE AMENDING THE [City/County of Jurisdiction] CODE TO REQUIRE ALL ELECTRIC BUILDINGS 

[Cite section of municipal code] is amended by adding a new subchapter as follows:
 
Section 1: Intent
It is the intent of this Section to require that all newly constructed buildings and substantially remodeled buildings have no gas appliances or gas infrastructure.
Section 2: Definitions
[Optional. Modify to conform to local definition] ATTACHED ACCESSORY DWELLING UNIT is a unit that is no more than 500 square feet in size and contained entirely within a single-family residence. An Attached Accessory Dwelling Unit may include separate sanitation facilities or may share sanitation facilities with the existing structure.

[Optional] COMMERCIAL FOOD HEAT-PROCESSING EQUIPMENT is equipment used in a food establishment for heat-processing food or utensils and that produces grease vapors, steam, fumes, smoke, or odors that are required to be removed through a local exhaust ventilation system, as defined in the California Mechanical Code.
[Optional. Modify to conform to local definition] FREE-STANDING ACCESSORY DWELLING UNIT is a detached building that is not intended for sale separate from the primary residence, on a lot that is zoned for single family or multifamily use, located on the same lot as an existing dwelling, and does not exceed 1,200  square feet[footnoteRef:3] of total floor area. [3:  This is the default maximum ADU size under State law.  Cities may limit ADUs to as small as 850 square feet or as large as they wish.] 


FUEL GAS is a gas that is natural, manufactured, liquefied petroleum, or a mixture of these.
FUEL GAS INFRASTRUCTURE is Fuel Gas piping in or in connection with a building, structure or within the property lines of premises, extending from the point of delivery at the gas meter or gas tank as specified in the California Mechanical Code and Plumbing Code.
The definitions of newly constructed building and Substantial Remodel should be carefully crafted to ensure that they do not have unintended consequences elsewhere in the local code.  Sample text is provided below.  For a more thorough discussion see Substantial Remodels and New Construction Definitions.
NEWLY CONSTRUCTED BUILDING is a building that has never been used or occupied for any purpose. 	
PROCESS is an activity or treatment that is not related to the space conditioning, lighting, service water heating, or ventilating of a building as it relates to human occupancy. 
PROCESS LOAD is an energy load resulting from a Process.	
SUBSTANTIAL REMODEL [Examples below]
· is any repair, reconstruction, rehabilitation, alteration, addition, or other improvement of a building structure, the cost of which equals or exceeds 50 percent of the market value of the structure before the improvement or repair is started. If the structure has sustained substantial damage, any repairs are considered substantial improvement regardless of the actual repair work performed.[footnoteRef:4]  [4:  Based on definition in the California Building Code (Title 24, Part 2).] 

· is any alteration(s) made within any three-year period that includes replacement of over 50 percent of the existing foundation for purposes other than a repair or reinforcement as defined in California Existing Building Code Section 202; or where over 50 percent of the existing framing above the sill plate is removed or replaced for purposes other than repair. 
· is any project that requires an electrical permit, a mechanical permit and a plumbing permit, with the exception of projects with a total valuation of less than $XX,XXX [specify value].
Section 3: Requirements
No building permit shall be issued for a Newly Constructed Building or Substantial Remodel that includes Fuel Gas Infrastructure. These requirements shall apply to Zoning permit [use appropriate local term] applications for new buildings submitted on or after the effective date of this ordinance and building permit applications for new buildings that do not require Zoning permits [use appropriate local term] submitted 120 days after the effective date of this chapter.   
Fuel Gas Infrastructure may not be extended to any All-Electric building which was originally constructed under a building permit application submitted on or after the effective date of this Chapter.
These requirements shall remain in perpetuity unless granted an exemption to the requirements of this Chapter. 
Any buildings exempted from these requirements shall comply with the requirements below:
· Install sufficient reserved circuit breakers and electrical conduit to facilitate future full building electrification as certified by affidavit of either a Registered Design Professional or a Licensed Electrical Contractor.

· Meet the requirements of Section 140.1 of the Energy Code, Title 24, Part 6 as amended.

Section 4: Exemptions [modify as needed]
3. If the applicant establishes that there is not an all-electric prescriptive compliance pathway for the building under the California Building Energy Efficiency Standards, and that the building is not able to achieve the performance compliance standard applicable to the building under the Energy Efficiency Standards using commercially available technology and an approved calculation method, or if it is not technically feasible to meet the requirements of this Section, then the local enforcing agency may grant a modification.
Alternative: If the applicant demonstrates that it is physically or technically infeasible to build without Fuel Gas Infrastructure the local enforcing agency may grant a modification.
4. Provision of Natural Gas Infrastructure for certain end uses is allowed when no all-electric alternative is commercially available or viable. End uses eligible for technical exemptions are: 
a. Back-up power for Essential Facilities, as defined in the California Building Code, Chapter 2, Section 202, Definitions. 
b. Process Loads in a Newly Constructed manufacturing, industrial, healthcare or laboratory facility. For manufacturing, industrial, hospital or laboratory facilities with unknown tenants, exemptions may be provided pending review of initial tenant occupancy.
5. Inactive Fuel Gas Infrastructure may be extended to spaces that are anticipated to qualify for the exceptions contained in this chapter. The inactive Fuel Gas Infrastructure shall not be activated or otherwise used unless the exemptions specified in this chapter have been confirmed as part of the issuance of a building permit.
6. Any project for improvement of a building required to correct existing health, sanitary or safety code violations identified by the building official and that are the minimum necessary to assure safe living conditions.
7. The local enforcing agency may grant a modification for Substantial Remodels to a tenant-occupied portion of a building that was originally permitted before the effective date of this ordinance. [The intent is to exempt a tenant improvement from triggering electrification of the entire building].
8. [Optional] Spas.
9. [Optional. If used, add ADUs to definitions.] Free-Standing Accessory Dwelling Units [cost-effective ADUs are limited to a few climate zones/utilities]
10. [Optional. If used, add ADUs to definitions.] Water heating or space heating in an attached Accessory Dwelling Unit in which new services are provided by existing systems from an existing mixed fuel building.
Section 5: Revocable Exemptions
[Optional] Notwithstanding the requirements of this Chapter, minimally necessary and specifically tailored Fuel Gas Infrastructure that qualify for exceptions under this Section shall be allowed in a Newly Constructed Building or Substantial Remodel on a revocable basis until the excepted uses below no longer exist in the building.  At such time, the Fuel Gas Infrastructure shall be capped, otherwise terminated or removed, and the gas meter shall be removed, by the entity previously entitled to the exemption in a manner pursuant to all applicable Codes.


[bookmark: _Toc151346595][bookmark: _Toc997207345][bookmark: _Toc230706061]Sample Energy Reach Code for New Buildings
ORDINANCE AMENDING THE [City/County of Jurisdiction] BUILDING CODE TO REQUIRE HIGHER ENERGY PERFORMANCE FOR NEW CONSTRUCTION

DELETE ALL BLUE TEXT AND FOOTNOTES

The California Building Code, Title 24, Part 6, adopted by the [City/County of jurisdiction] codified under Chapter [municipal/county code reference (if not adopted in entirety, include local code references for each section)], is amended as specified below. 
[bookmark: _Toc14856746][bookmark: _Toc15996891][bookmark: _Toc15997099][bookmark: _Toc505149230][bookmark: _Toc55413754]Purpose and Intent
Section 100.0(e)2A is modified as follows:
All newly constructed buildings. Sections 110.0 through 110.12 apply to all newly constructed buildings within the scope of Section 100.0(a). In addition, newly constructed buildings shall meet the requirements of Subsections B, C, D or E, as applicable, as well as Subsection G.
A new section, 100.0(e)2.G, is added as follows:
(G) New Construction Energy Reach Code - Purpose and Intent. 
In addition to all the requirements of the California Energy Code applicable to new construction, the following shall apply:
i. All newly constructed buildings shall be subject to stricter energy standards than are otherwise required under the California Energy Code. 
ii. [Optional] All newly constructed buildings shall be required to install a solar PV system.
EXCEPTIONS to 100.0(e)2.G. [insert exceptions by occupancy/building type, such as ADUs, if applicable]

[bookmark: _Toc14856747][bookmark: _Toc15996892][bookmark: _Toc15997100][bookmark: _Toc808564031][bookmark: _Toc423565892]Definitions
Section 100.1(b) is modified by adding the following definitions: 
[Optional: include if specifying a different compliance margin for All-Electric Buildings] ALL-ELECTRIC BUILDING is a building that contains no combustion equipment or plumbing for combustion equipment (except for abandoned gas lines) serving space heating (including fireplaces), water heating (including pools and spas), cooking appliances (including barbeques), and clothes drying, within the building or building property lines, and instead uses electric heating appliances for service.  An All-Electric Building may include solar thermal collectors. [Modify end uses as needed.  The reference to abandoned gas plumbing makes this definition compatible with the model renovation ordinance. The reference to solar thermal panels clarifies that solar thermal is an allowed energy source for heating.]
[Optional] CERTIFIED ENERGY ANALYST is a person registered as a Certified Energy Analyst with the California Association of Building Energy Consultants as of the date of submission of a Certificate of Compliance as required under Section 10.103.[footnoteRef:5] [5:  From Government Code Section 65852.22.] 

[ADUs can either be excepted or subject to specific requirements supported by the Cost Effectiveness Study.   In either case, the definition should be modified to conform to local code, as applicable] FREE-STANDING ACCESSORY DWELLING UNIT is a detached building that is not intended for sale separate from the primary residence, on a lot that is zoned for single family or multifamily use, located on the same lot as an existing dwelling, and does not exceed 1,200[footnoteRef:6] square feet of total floor area.  [6:  This is the default maximum ADU size under State law.  Cities may limit ADUs to as small as 850 square feet or as large as they wish.] 


[bookmark: _Toc904804739][bookmark: _Toc213786208]Energy Efficiency Requirements
Nonresidential Buildings
Section 140.1 is modified as follows: 
SECTION 140.1 – PERFORMANCE APPROACH: ENERGY BUDGETS 
An addition or alteration to an existing building or a newly constructed All-Electric Building complies with the performance approach if the energy budget calculated for the Proposed Design Building under Subsection (b) is no greater than the energy budget calculated for the Standard Design Building under Subsection (a). 
A newly constructed Mixed-Fuel Building complies with the performance approach if the energy budget calculated for the Proposed Design Building under Subsection (b) has a compliance margin, relative to the energy budget calculated for the Standard Design Building under Subsection (a), of at least XX% for Total TDV energy, YY% for Efficiency TDV energy and ZZ% for Total source energy.  [Add phrase below, if not adopting an all-electric ordinance] In addition, a newly constructed mixed-fuel building shall install sufficient reserved circuit breakers and electrical conduit to facilitate future full building electrification as certified by affidavit of either a Registered Design Professional or a Licensed Electrical Contractor.

(a) Energy Budget for the Standard Design Building. The energy budget for the Standard Design Building is determined by applying the mandatory and prescriptive requirements to the Proposed Design Building. The energy budget is the sum of the source energy and TDV energy for space-conditioning, indoor lighting, mechanical ventilation, photovoltaic (PV) and battery storage systems, service water heating, and covered process loads. 
(b) Energy Budget for the Proposed Design Building. The energy budget for a Proposed Design Building is determined by calculating the source energy and TDV energy for the Proposed Design Building. The energy budget is the sum of the source energy and TDV energy for space-conditioning, indoor lighting, mechanical ventilation, photovoltaic (PV) and battery storage systems, and service water heating and covered process loads. 
(c) Calculation of Energy Budget. The TDV energy for both the Standard Design Building and the Proposed Design Building shall be computed by Compliance Software certified for this use by the Commission. The processes for Compliance Software approval by the Commission are documented in the ACM Approval Manual. 
EXCEPTION 1 to Section 140.1. For newly constructed buildings, if the Certificate of Compliance is prepared and signed by a Certified Energy Analyst and the energy budget for the Proposed Design is no greater than the Standard Design Building, the required compliance margin is reduced by 1%, but in no event shall be less than 0. 
EXCEPTION 2 to Section 140.1. Hospitals and newly constructed buildings with mechanical systems but no indoor lighting may comply with a 0% compliance margin.
NOTE: Authority: Sections 25213, 25218, 25218.5, 25402 and 25402.1, Public Resources Code. Reference: Sections 25007, 25008, 25218.5, 25310, 25402, 25402.1, 25402.4, 25402.5, 25402.8, and 25943, Public Resources Code. 

[bookmark: _Toc2028936273][bookmark: _Toc1500731592]Single Family Residential Buildings
[bookmark: _Toc52280787][bookmark: _Toc900071951]Performance Requirements
A new section, 150.1(b)1A, is added as follows: 

In addition, the Efficiency Energy Design Rating 2 (EDR2-eff) for the Proposed Building shall have a compliance margin of at least X [insert value for the appropriate climate zone from the Cost Effectiveness Explorer.  Add values for additional climate zones if applicable. Add reference and separate values for All-Electric buildings if applicable] points less than the Efficiency Energy Design Rating 2 (EDR2-eff) for the Standard Design Building.  [Optional, if ADUs are not excepted] Free-Standing Accessory Dwelling Units shall have an Efficiency Energy Design Rating 2 (EDR2-eff) compliance margin of at least Y.

[Optional] EXCEPTION 1 to Section 150.1(b)1.A. If the Certificate of Compliance is prepared and signed by a Certified Energy Analyst, the Efficiency Energy Design Rating (EDR2-eff) compliance margin may be reduced to [X from above less one but not less than zero].

[Optional] EXCEPTION 2 to Section 150.1(b)1.A. A Free-Standing Accessory Dwelling Unit.

[bookmark: _Toc684878593][bookmark: _Hlk92214931]Multifamily Residential Buildings

The first paragraph of Section 170.1 is modified as follows:
An addition or alteration to an existing building or a newly constructed All-Electric Building complies with the performance approach if the energy budget calculated for the Proposed Design Building under Subsection (b) is no greater than the energy budget calculated for the Standard Design Building under Subsection (a).  
[bookmark: aenergybudgetforthestandarddesignbuildin]
A newly constructed Mixed-Fuel Building complies with the performance approach if the energy budget calculated for the Proposed Design Building under Subsection (b) has a compliance margin, relative to the energy budget calculated for the Standard Design Building under Subsection (a), of at least XX % for Efficiency TDV energy and YY% for Total source energy.  [Add phrase below, if not adopting an all-electric ordinance] In addition, a newly constructed mixed-fuel building shall install sufficient reserved circuit breakers and electrical conduit to facilitate future full building electrification as certified by affidavit of either a Registered Design Professional or a Licensed Electrical Contractor.


Prescriptive Requirements
There are no prescriptive requirements included in the model ordinance.   A set of prescriptive measures can be provided upon request.  Please contact the Reach Codes Program at info@localenergycodes.com.

[bookmark: _Toc719107711][bookmark: _Toc1675129740]
Additional Solar PV Requirements (optional)
Single Family Buildings
The first two paragraphs of Section 150.0 - MANDATORY FEATURES AND DEVICES, are modified as follows: 
Single-family residential buildings shall comply with the applicable requirements of Sections 150(a) through 150.0(vx).
NOTE: The requirements of Sections 150.0(a) through 150.0(vx) apply to newly constructed buildings. Sections 150.2(a) and 150.2(b) specify which requirements of Sections 150.0(a) through 150.0(vx) also apply to additions or alterations.[footnoteRef:7]  [7:  Note, Part 6 reference 150.0(r), but this appears to be an error that should read 150.0(v) to include the new sections s, t, u and v.] 

New sections, 150.0(w) and 150.0(x) – are added as follows:
150.0(w) Reserved for future use [renovation reach code]
150.0(x) Mandatory Requirements for Solar
The requirements of Section 150.1(c)14 are mandatory.  In addition, the PV system size shall be the larger of the requirements in Section 150.1(c)14 or X% [specify a value no greater than 100%] of the projected electrical consumption.
[bookmark: _Toc1166387816][bookmark: _Toc955909688]Exception to 150.0(x): All of the exceptions in Section 150.1(c)14 apply.

Other Sample Ordinance Sections
Section 2: CEQA 
This ordinance is exempt from CEQA under 15061(b)(3) on the grounds that these standards are more stringent than the State energy standards, there are no reasonably foreseeable adverse impacts and there is no possibility that the activity in question may have a significant effect on the environment. 

Section 3: Severability 
If any word, phrase sentence part, section, subsection or other portion of this amendment or any application thereof to any person or circumstance is declared void, unconstitutional, or invalid for any reason, then such word, phrase, sentence, part, section, subsection, or other portion, or the prescribed application thereof, shall be severable, and the remaining provisions of this amendment, and all applications thereof, not having been declared void, unconstitutional or invalid, shall remain in full force and effect.  The [name of governing body] hereby declares that it would have passed this amendment and each section, subsection sentence, clause and phrase of this amendment, irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections, subsection, sentences, clauses or phrases is declared invalid or unconstitutional. 

Section 4: Violations 
Violation of the requirements of this Chapter shall be considered an infraction of the [jurisdiction Municipal/County Code], punishable by all the sanctions prescribed in [cite local reference to infractions]. 

Section 5: Effective Date [exclude reference to CBSC if not amending Title 24]
This ordinance shall become effective as of [DATE], except that the amendments to California Building Code, Title 24, Part 6 shall become effective as of [DATE] or upon the date the California Building Standards Commission (CBSC) accepts the ordinance for filing, whichever is later.

2023-03-15		2
image1.gif
CALIFORNIA

CODES & STANDARDS
A STATEWIDE UTILITY PROGRAM




